MINUTES, LIMESTONE COUNTY COMMISSION, SEPTEMBER 28, 2016

The Limestone County Commission reconvened the meeting from September 19, 2016
at 10:00 a.m. today at the Washington Street Courthouse Annex, 310 West Washington
Street, Athens, AL.

Present. Stanley Hill, Steve Turner, Jason Black, and Ben Harrison. Absent: None.
Mark Yarbrough, Chairman presided.

MOTION was made by Ben Harrison and seconded by Jason Black to suspend the
Rules of Order to approve bid for Bituminous Treatment Resurfacing.

The Administrator called the roll. Ben Harrison, aye; Jason Black, aye; Stanley Hill,
aye; and Steve Turner, aye. Motion carries unanimously.

MOTION was made by Ben Harrison and seconded by Jason Black to award the
following bid proposals to the lowest responsible bidder meeting specifications as
follows:

Proposal Item Awarded to
No.
2594 Bituminous Treatment Resurfacing Charles E. Watts, Inc.

BITUMINOUS TREATMENT
PER SQUARE YARD

DESCRIPTION COMPLETED IN PLACE
Item No. 401A-000 Bituminous Treatment A
NO BID /SYCIP0-13000 SY
NO BID /SYCIP13000-65000 SY
NO BID /SYCIP65000-130000 SY
NO BID /SYCIP130000 SY and above
Item No 401A-003 Bituminous Treatment D
With Stone $ 3.68 /SYCIP0-13000 SY
$ 1.27 /SYCIP13000-65000 SY
$ 1.08 /SYCIP65000-130000 SY
$ 1.06 /SYCIP130000 SY and above
With Granite $ 3.89 /SYCIP0-13000 SY
$ 1.48 /SYCIP13000-65000 SY
$ 1.29 /SYCIP65000-130000 SY
$ 1.27 /SYCIP130000 SY and above
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Item No. 401B-117
With Stone

With Granite

Item No. 401A-006
With Stone

With Granite

Item No. 401B-008
With Stone

With Granite

Iltem No. 401A-013
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Bituminous Treatment D (with polymer additive)

/SYCIP0-13000 SY
/SYCIP13000-65000 SY
/SYCIP65000-130000 SY
/SYCIP130000 SY and above

/SYCIP0-13000 SY
/SYCIP13000-65000 SY
/SYCIP65000-130000 SY
/SYCIP130000 SY and above

/SYCIPO-13000 SY
/SYCIP13000-65000 SY
/SYCIP65000-130000 SY
/SYCIP130000 SY and above

/SYCIP0-13000 SY
/SYCIP13000-65000 SY
/SYCIP65000-130000 SY
/SYCIP130000 SY and above
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Bituminous Treatment G (with polymer additive)
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0-13000 SY
13000-65000 SY
65000-130000 SY
130000 SY and above

0-13000 SY
13000-65000 SY
65000-130000 SY
130000 SY and above

0-13000 SY
13000-65000 SY
65000-130000 SY
130000 SY and above
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Iltem No. 401B-006 Bituminous Treatment JG (with polymer additive) - Stone
$ 6.17 /SYCIP  0-13000 SY
$ 3.27 /SYCIP  13000-65000 SY
$ 3.23 /ISYCIP  65000-130000 SY
$ 3.73 /SYCIP 130000 SY and above
1 Item No. 409A-001 Triple Bituminous Treatment
With Stone $ 6.91 /SYCIP  0-13000 SY

$ 3.68 /SYCIP  13000-65000 SY
$ 3.71 /ISYCIP  65000-130000 SY
$ 3.21 /SYCIP 130000 SY and above

With Granite $ 7.36 /SYCIP  0-13000 SY
$ 4.13 /SYCIP  13000-65000 SY
$ 3.66 /ISYCIP  65000-130000 SY
$ 3.66 /SYCIP 130000 SY and above

The Chairman asked if there was any discussion.

There was no discussion. The

Administrator called the roll. Ben Harrison, aye; Jason Black, aye; Stanley Hill, aye; and

Steve Turner, aye. Motion carries unanimously.

Items were discussed for the October 3, 2016 agenda.

Adjourned at 10:26 a.m.



