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The Limestone County Commission reconvened the meeting from March 16, 2015 at 
10:00 a.m. today at the Washington Street Courthouse Annex, 310 West Washington 
Street, Athens, AL.  
 
Present:  Stanley Hill, Steve Turner, and Jason Black.  Absent:  Ben Harrison.  Mark 
Yarbrough, Chairman presided. 
 
MOTION was made by Steve Turner and seconded by Stanley Hill to suspend the 
Rules of Order to approve Limestone County Commission as fiscal agent for a grant. 
 
The Administrator called the roll.  Steve Turner, aye; Stanley Hill, aye; and Jason Black, 
aye.  Motion carries unanimously. 
 
MOTION was made by Stanley Hill and seconded by Steve Turner to give permission 
for the Limestone County Commission to be the fiscal agent for a Department of Youth 
Services 2015/2016 Diversion Grant. 
 
The Chairman asked if there was any discussion.  There was no discussion.  The 
Administrator called the roll.  Stanley Hill, aye; Steve Turner, aye; and Jason Black, aye.  
Motion carries unanimously. 
 
MOTION was made by Jason Black and seconded by Steve Turner to suspend the 
Rules of Order to approve agreements with J. M. Wood to auction dump trucks. 
 
The Administrator called the roll.  Jason Black, aye; Steve Turner, aye; and Stanley Hill, 
aye.  Motion carries unanimously. 
 
MOTION was made by Jason Black and seconded by Steve Turner to approve 
agreements with J. M. Wood to auction the following Mack dump trucks: 
 

 
Department 

 

 
Item 

 
Serial # 

District 1 2007 Mack CV713 tri-axel truck 1M2AG11C07M0602 

District 2 2007 Mack CV713 tri-axel truck 1M2AG11C47M051161 

District 3 2007 Mack CV713 tri-axel truck 1M2AG11C87M046110 

District 3 2007 Mack CV713 tri-axel truck 1M2AG11C67M051161 

 
The Chairman asked if there was any discussion.  There was no discussion.  The 
Administrator called the roll.  Jason Black, aye; Steve Turner, aye; and Stanley Hill, aye.  
Motion carries unanimously.  
 
MOTION was made by Steve Turner and seconded by Jason Black to suspend the 
Rules of Order to approve bids. 
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The Administrator called the roll.  Steve Turner, aye; Jason Black, aye; and Stanley Hill, 
aye.  Motion carries unanimously. 
 
MOTION was made by Jason Black and seconded by Steve Turner to award the 
following bid proposals to the lowest responsible bidder meeting specifications as 
follows: 
 

 
Proposal No. 

 
Item 

 
Awarded To 

2524 Horizontal Elliptical Concrete Pipe 
(Delivered) 

No bids received. 
Unable to negotiated 

2525 Horizontal Elliptical Concrete Pipe 
(Picked up) 

No bids received. 
Unable to negotiated 

2526 Concrete Pipe 
(Picked up) 

Hanson Pipe & Precast 
No bids received 
Negotiated price 

2527 Concrete Pipe 
(Delivered) 

Hanson Pipe & Precast 
No bids received 
Negotiated price 

2528 Concrete Arch Pipe 
(Picked up) 

Hanson Pipe & Precast 
No bids received 
Negotiated price 

2529 Concrete Arch Pipe 
(Delivered) 

Hanson Pipe & Precast 
No bids received 
Negotiated price 

2530 Crushed Limestone 
(Picked up) 

Rogers Groups, Inc. Tanner 
& Hoover, Inc. Huntsville 

2531 Crushed Limestone 
(Delivered) 

Rogers Groups, Inc. Tanner 

2532 Plant Mix 
(Picked up & Delivered) 

Wiregrass Construction Co. 
Joe Keenum Excavation 

Reed Contracting Services 
APAC Mid-South, Inc. 

2533 Traffic Striping J. C. Cheek Contractors  

2534 Liquid Asphalt  
(Picked up & Delivered) 

Vulcan Asphalt 
Ergon Asphalt (back-up) 

2535 Steel Slag Stein, Inc. 

2536 Crusher Run Limestone 
(Picked up & Self-Load) 

Rogers Groups, Inc. Tanner 
No bids received 
Negotiated price 

2537 High Performance Asphalt Cold  
Patch Material 
(Picked up &Delivered) 

Advanced Asphalt Products 
Wiregrass Const. (back-up) 
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CONCRETE PIPE - PICKED UP 
 Bid Proposal No. 2526  

April 1, 2015 – March 31, 2016 
 

Hanson Pipe & Precast 
 

Size 
 

Price Per Foot 
PICKED UP 

24 Feet Price 
PICKED UP 

Customer Installed 
Price 

PRICE TO 
COVER 
OWNER 

SUPPLIED 
PIPE 

    
PER 

FOOT 

 
24 FT. 

 
FLAT FEE  

 
12” 

 
$10.75 

 
$258.00 

 
$23.33 

 
$560.00 

 
$350.00 

 
15” 

 
$12.85 

 
$308.40 

 
$26.67 

 
$640.00 

 
$350.00 

 
18” 

 
$14.25 

 
$342.00 

 
$29.17 

 
$700.00 

 
$360.00 

 
24” 

 
$22.10 

 
$530.40 

 
$37.50 

 
$900.00 

 
$400.00 

 
30” 

 
$31.00 

 
$744.00 

 
$48.33 

 
$1,160.00 

 
$450.00 

 
36” 

 
$42.00 

 
$1,008.00 

 
$60.83 

 
$1,460.00 

 
$480.00 

 
42” 

 
$52.50 

 
$1,260.00 

 
$77.50 

 
$1,860.00 

 
$550.00 

 
48” 

 
$65.80 

 
$1,579.00 

 
$97.50 

 
$2,340.00 

 
$650.00 

 
54” 

 
$94.00 

 
$2,256.00 

   

 
60” 

 
$114.00 

 
$2,736.00 

   

 
72” 

 
$159.50 

 
$3,828.00 
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CONCRETE PIPE - DELIVERED 
Bid Proposal No. 2527 

April 1, 2015 – March 31, 2016 
 

Hanson Pipe & Precast 
 

Size 
 

Price Per Foot 
DELIVERED 

24 Feet Price 
DELIVERED 

 
12” 

 
$11.50 

 
$276.00 

 
15” 

 
$13.50 

 
$324.00 

 
18” 

 
$15.00 

 
$360.00 

 
24” 

 
$23.50 

 
$564.00 

 
30” 

 
$32.50 

 
$780.00 

 
36” 

 
$43.25 

 
$1,038.00 

 
42” 

 
$54.00 

 
$1,296.00 

 
48” 

 
$66.50 

 
$1,596.00 

 
54” 

 
$97.00 

 
$2,328.00 

 
60” 

 
$119.00 

 
$2,856.00 

 
72” 

 
$163.25 

 
$3,918.00 
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ARCHED CONCRETE PIPE  
(Picked Up) 

Bid Proposal No. 2528 
April 1, 2015 – March 31, 2016 

 
Hanson Pipe & Precast 

 

 
Size 

 
Price Per Foot 

 
24 Feet 
Price 

 
Customer Installed 

Price 

 
Price to Cover 

Owner Supplied 
Pipe 

    
PER 

FOOT 

 
24 FT. 

 
FLAT FEE 

 
15” 

(11x18) 

 
$17.55 

 
$421.50 

 
$30.83 

 
$740.00 

 

 
$350.00 

 
18” 

(13x22) 

 
$21.15 

 
$507.60 

 
$35.00 

 
$840.00 

 
$350.00 

 
24” 

(18x28) 

 
$28.00 

 
$672.00 

 
$45.83 

 
$1,100.00 

 
$350.00 

 
30” 

(22x36) 

 
$39.50 

 
$948.00 

 
$58.33 

 
$1,400.00 

 
$400.00 

 
36” 

(27x44) 

 
$54.00 

 
$1,296.00 

 
$73.33 

 
$1,760.00 

 
$450.00 

 
42” 

(31x51) 

 
$66.00 

 
$1,584.00 

 
$90.83 

 
$2,180.00 

 
$500.00 

 
48” 

(36x58) 

 
$81.25 

 
$1,950.00 

 
$112.50 

 
$2,700.00 

 
$600.00 
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ARCHED CONCRETE PIPE - DELIVERED 
Bid Proposal No. 2529 

April 1, 2015 – March 31, 2016 
 

Hanson Pipe & Precast 
 

Size Price Per Foot 24 Feet Price 

 
15” (11x18) 

 
$19.50 

 
$468.00 

 
18” (13x22) 

 
$23.50 

 
$564.00 

 
24” (18x28) 

 
$30.10 

 
$722.40 

 
30” (22x36) 

 
$42.35 

 
$1,016.40 

 
36” (27x44) 

 
$56.00 

 
$1,344.00 

 
42” (31x51) 

 
$69.60 

 
$1,670.40 

 
48” (36x58) 

 
$82.80 

 
$1,987.20 

 
54” (40x65) 

 
$102.55 

 
$2,461.20 

 
60” (45x73) 

 
$124.20 

 
$2,980.80 

 
72” (54x88) 

 
$173.10 

 
$4,154.40 
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CRUSHED STONE 
(Picked Up) 

Bid Proposal No. 2530 
April 1, 2015 – March 31, 2016 

 
* When making purchases, Districts should select the vendor closest  

to the jobsite where the material is needed. 
 

 Rogers Group, Inc. - Tanner Quarry – PICKED UP 
 
Washed Paving 

Rock 
#5, #6, #7, #56, 

#57,#78, #89 

Crusher 
Run 

 

Crushed 
Limestone 
Screenings 

Pug Mix 
Type B 

Surge Rock Rip Rap 
Class 1 or 2 

Block 
Material 

$11.50/Ton $9.50/Ton $9.50/Ton $10.50/Ton $10.50/Ton $13.00/Ton $10.75/Ton 

 
Hoover, Inc. – Huntsville Quarry – PICKED UP 

 
Washed Paving 
Rock 
 #57 & #67 

Crusher 
Run 
 

Crushed 
Limestone 
Screenings 

Pug Mix  
Type B 

Surge Rock Rip Rap 
Class 1 or 2 

Block 
Material 

$12.05/Ton (#57 
& #67) 
$12.55/Ton (#78) 

$11.00 (1 
½ , ¾ & 
810) 

$11.00/Ton $11.00/Ton $11.30/Ton $13.50/Ton 
(Class 2) 

No bid 

 
 

CRUSHED STONE 
(Delivered) 

Bid Proposal No. 2531 
April 1, 2015 – March 31, 2016 

 
Rogers Group, Inc. - Tanner Quarry 

 

Washed 
Paving Rock 
#5, #6, #7, 
#56, #57,#78, 
#89 

Crusher 
Run 
 

Crushed 
Limestone 
Screening
s 

Pug Mix  
Type B 

Surge 
Rock 

Rip Rap 
Class 1 
or 2 

Block 
Material 

$15.25/Ton  
For all 
Districts 

$13.25/Ton  
For all 
Districts 

$13.25/Ton 
For all 
Districts 

$14.25/To
n 
For all 
Districts 

$14.25/To
n 
For all 
Districts 

$16.75/To
n 
For all 
Districts 

$14.50To
n 
For all 
Districts 
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PLANT MIX 
(Picked Up & Delivered) 
Bid Proposal No. 2532 

April 1, 2015 – March 31, 2016 
 

Wiregrass Construction Co, Inc. 
 

 Picked Up Price Delivered 

Bituminous Concrete Binder 
Layer or Plant Mix Bituminous 
Base ALDOT Spec. Sections 
327 or 424 

$49.00 $55.00 

Bituminous Concrete Plant Mix 
ALDOT Spec. Sections 424 
Limestone Aggregate 

$59.00 $65.00 

Bituminous Concrete Plant Mix 
ALDOT Spec. Sections 424 
Siliceous Aggregate 

$59.00 
 

$65.00 

 
Joe Keenum Excavation & Construction, Inc. 

 

 Picked Up Price Delivered 

Bituminous Concrete Binder 
Layer or Plant Mix Bituminous 
Base ALDOT Spec. Sections 
327 or 424 

$57.00 $65.00 

Bituminous Concrete Plant Mix 
ALDOT Spec. Sections 424 
Limestone Aggregate 

$63.00 $71.00 

Bituminous Concrete Plant Mix 
ALDOT Spec. Sections 424 

$66.00 
 

$74.00 

 
Reed Contracting Services, Inc. 

 

 Picked Up Price Delivered 

Bituminous Concrete Binder 
Layer or Plant Mix Bituminous 
Base ALDOT Spec. Sections 
327 or 424 

$48.00 $60.00 

Bituminous Concrete Plant Mix 
ALDOT Spec. Sections 424 
Limestone Aggregate 

$55.00 $67.00 

Bituminous Concrete Plant Mix 
ALDOT Spec. Sections 424 

$57.00 
 

$69.00 

 
 



MINUTES, LIMESTONE COUNTY COMMISSION, APRIL 1, 2015 
 

9 
 

Midsouth Paving, Inc. 
 

 Picked Up Price Delivered 

Bituminous Concrete Binder 
Layer or Plant Mix Bituminous 
Base ALDOT Spec. Sections 
327 or 424 

$53.00 $63.00 

Bituminous Concrete Plant Mix 
ALDOT Spec. Sections 424 
Limestone Aggregate 

$59.00 $69.00 

Bituminous Concrete Plant Mix 
ALDOT Spec. Sections 424 

$60.00 
 

$70.00 

 
 

TRAFFIC STRIPING 
Proposal No. 2533 

April 1, 2015 – March 31, 2016 
 

J. C. Cheek Contractors 
 

Description Cost  

Permanent Traffic Stripe (4” Wide)  

 Broken Yellow (Class 1, Type A) $235.00 per mile 

 Solid Yellow (Class 1, Type A) $460.00 per mile 

 Solid White (Class 1, Type A) $460.00 per mile 

 Broken White (Class 1, Type 1) $235.00 per mile 

 Broken Yellow (Class 2T, Type A) $800.00 per mile 

 Solid Yellow (Class 2T, Type A) $1,600.00 per mile 

 Solid White (Class 2T, Type A) $1,600.00 per mile 

 Broken White (Class 2T, Type A) $800.00 per mile 

Permanent Traffic Stripe (5” Wide)  

 Broken Yellow (Class 1, Type A) $265.00 per mile 

 Solid Yellow (Class 1, Type A) $490.00 per mile 

 Solid White (Class 1, Type A) $490.00 per mile 

 Broken White (Class 1, Type A) $265.00 per mile 

 Broken Yellow (Class 2T, Type A)    $950.00 per mile 

 Solid Yellow (Class 2T, Type A) $1,700.00 per mile 

 Solid  White (Class 2T, Type A) $1,700.00 per mile 

 Broken White (Class 2T, Type A) $950.00 per mile 
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Temporary Stripe (4” Wide)  

 Broken Yellow (Class 1, Type A) $600.00 per mile 

 Solid Yellow (Class 1, Type A) $675.00 per mile 

 Solid White (Class 1, Type A) $675.00 per mile 

 Broken White (Class 1, Type A) $600.00 per mile 

Markings & Legends  

 Traffic Control Markings (Class 1, Type A) $2.25 per square foot 

 Traffic Control Legends (Class 1, Type A) $2.50 per square foot 

 Traffic Control Markings (Class 2, Type A) $4.50 per square foot 

 Traffic Control Legends (Class 2, Type A) $4.75 per square foot 

Pavement Markers  

 Class A-H (All Types) $5.00 each 

 
 

LIQUID ASPHALT 
(Picked Up & Delivered) 
Bid Proposal No. 2534 

April 1, 2015 – March 31, 2016 
 

Note:  Vulcan is the preferred vendor with Ergon being the “back-up” bid if Vulcan cannot supply 
the material when needed.  There was no responsive bid for  tack” material picked up within 30 
miles of Limestone County, and when needed, it is recommended that a price be negotiated 
with Wiregrass Contracting to purchase this material at their Trinity plant location . 

 
 

Vulcan Asphalt 
Location:  Cordova, AL 

 

 Price Per Gallon 

CR-2 Emulsion $1.89 Picked Up 
$1.83 Delivered 

 

CRS-2p Emulsion $2.09 Picked Up 
$2.03 Delivered 

 

RS-2 & CRS-2h  No bid 
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Back-Up Vendor 
Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions, Inc. 

 

 Delivered Price Per 
Gallon 

CR-2 Emulsion 
Delivered prices based on 
delivery of full transport 
quantities.  Demurrage:  2 
hours free; $65/hr thereafter. 
Drop tanker @ $250.00/day if 
needed.  If needed, pump 
charge @ $65.00. 

$1.75 Picked Up 
$1.87 Delivered 

CRS-2p Emulsion $1.98 Picked Up 
$2.10 Delivered 

CRS-2 & CRS-2h Only $1.75  

 
 

“Tack Material” Vendor 
Wiregrass Construction Co., Inc. 

 

 Delivered Price Per 
Gallon 

CRS-2 & CRS-2h, CSS 1, 
CSS1h or NTSS 1HM or any or 
other approved Tack Coat 
Material 

Negotiated Price 

 
 

STEEL SLAG 
Bid Proposal No. 2535 

April 1, 2015 – March 31, 2016 
 

Stein, Inc. 
 

1/2”x 0” #899 
(3/8”x 0”) 

3/4”x 3/8” 2” x 3/4" 4” x 2” 1 ¼ “ x 0” 

$1.50 
per ton 

$9.00 
per ton 

$4.50 
per ton 

$2.00 
per ton 

$1.00 
per ton 

$0.25 
per ton 
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CRUSHER RUN LIMESTONE  
(Picked Up/Self Load) 
Bid Proposal No. 2536 

 
Rogers Group, Inc. – Elkmont, AL 

 

Crusher Run 
Limestone 

$4.50/Ton 
For all Districts 

 
 

HIGH PERFORMANCE ASPHALT COLD PATCH MATERIAL 
Bid Proposal No. 2537 

April 1, 2015 – March 31, 2016 
 

ADVANCED ASPHALT PRODUCTS, LLC 
**DELIVERED & PICKED UP** 

Jasper Plant 
 

PICKED UP  - BULK DELIVERED - BULK 

$85.00/Ton $95.50/Ton 

PICKED UP -50LB. BAGS  DELIVERED – 50LB. BAGS  

$12.80/Bag $14.80/Bag 

PICKED UP - 5 GAL. PAILS  DELIVERED – 5 GAL. PAILS  

$13.80/Pail $15.80/Pail 

 
Note:  Advanced Asphalt Products LLC is to be the primary vendor with Wiregrass 
Construction as a “back-up” vendor if material is not available from advanced asphalt 
products. 
 

BACK-UP VENDOR: 
 

WIREGRASS CONTRACTING COMPANY 
**DELIVERED & PICKED UP** 

 

PICKED UP  - BULK DELIVERED - BULK 

$90.00/Ton $96.00/Ton 

 PICKED UP -50LB. BAGS   DELIVERED – 50LB. BAGS  

No bid No bid 

PICKED UP - 5 GAL. PAILS  DELIVERED – 5 GAL. PAILS  

No bid No  bid 
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The Chairman asked if there was any discussion.  There was no discussion.  The 
Administrator called the roll.  Jason Black, aye; Steve Turner, aye; and Stanley Hill.  
Motion carries unanimously.  
 
Items were discussed for the April 6, 2015 agenda. 
 
Adjourned at 10:55 a.m. 
 
 
 


